

Bid Tabulation Summary
Bid No. 10060988-15-F
Coupling Various Sizes, Water, Wastewater

Vendor	Total Section A	Total Section B	Total Section A and B	Total Section A and B with Tax
Hydro-Scape Products, Inc.	\$206,467.78	\$0.00	\$206,467.78	\$222,985.20
Pacific Pipeline Supply	\$128,283.00	\$85,746.60	\$214,029.60	\$231,151.97
Western Water Works Supply Company	\$131,354.75	\$85,067.00	\$216,421.75	\$233,735.49
Ferguson Waterworks	\$130,876.00	\$90,066.20	\$220,942.20	\$238,617.58

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Vendor: Ferguson Waterworks

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	1	8	EA	22025595	Coupling Adapter Flange 4" Range = 4.74-5.10, Smith-Blair 9129005004-000, Romac, FCA501-5010 or equal	Romac	\$94.00	\$752.00
A	2	15	EA	2202599	Coupling, Adapter (Flanged), 6", 6.68-7.20 Range, for Cast Iron and Asbestos-Cement Machined Ends; Romac FCA501-720 or equal	Romac	\$120.00	\$1,800.00
A	3	15	EA	22025601	Coupling, Adapter (Flanged), 8", 8.99-9.40 Range, for Cast Iron and Asbestos-Cement Machined Ends; Romac FCA501-940 or equal,	Romac	\$165.00	\$2,475.00
A	4	217	EA	22025700	Coupling CI & A/C ME 6" with Alloy Bolt 6.86-7.20, Smith-Blair 44100000722900, Romac 501-7.20 x 7.20 or equal	Romac	\$64.00	\$13,888.00
A	5	216	EA	22025704	Coupling CI & A/C ME 8" with Alloy Bolt 8.99-9.40, Smith-Blair 44100000945900, Romac 501-9.4 x 9.40 x 5 or equal	Romac	\$81.00	\$17,496.00
A	6	30	EA	22025705	Coupling CI 10" 10.89" – 11.40", Smith-Blair 441000001160900, Romac501-11.40 x 11.40 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$112.00	\$3,360.00
A	7	60	EA	22025706	Coupling CI 12" with Alloy Bolts 13.15-13.55, Smith-Blair 441000001350900, Romac 501-13.55 x 13.55 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$135.00	\$8,100.00
A	8	60	EA	22025708	Coupling End-Cap CI & A/C–ME 6" 2" FIP 6.86-7.2, Smith-Blair 48200072206900, Romac EC501-7.20 or equal	Romac	\$87.00	\$5,220.00
A	9	100	EA	22025709	Coupling End-Cap CI & A/C-ME 8" 2" FIP 8.99-9.4, Smith-Blair 48200094506900, Romac EC501-9.40 or equal	Romac	\$118.00	\$11,800.00

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	10	50	EA	22025710	Coupling, End Cap, CI 10", with 2" Female Iron Pipe Thread on End Cap Plug 10.89-11.40 Range, with Low Alloy Bolts; (for Cast Iron); Romac EC501-11.40 or equal	Romac	\$216.00	\$10,800.00
A	11	20	EA	22025711	Coupling End Cap A/C-ME 12" 2" FIP 13.85-14.1, Smith-Blair 48200142006900, Romac ec01-14.10 or equal	Romac	\$276.00	\$5,520.00
A	12	20	EA	22025712	Coupling End-Cap CI 12" with 2" FIP 13.15-13.55, Smith-Blair 4820013500680, Romac ec501-13.55 or equal	Romac	\$276.00	\$5,520.00
A	13	10	EA	22025714	Coupling End-Cap CI & DI 16" with 2" FIP 17.05-17.4, Smith-Blair 48117800114903, Romac ec501-17.40 or equal	Romac	\$556.00	\$5,560.00
A	14	18	EA	22025721	Coupling Flex 2" with Galv Bolts, Romac 501-2.38 x 2.38 x 5 or equal	Romac	\$25.00	\$450.00
A	15	75	EA	22025730	Coupling Flex 4" with Alloy Bolts 4.8ODX5.10 CI, Smith-Blair 44100000510900, Romac 501-5.1 x 4.81 x 5 or equal	Romac	\$47.00	\$3,525.00
A	16	30	EA	22025735	Coupling Flex 16" CI-PVC 17.40-17.80 ROMAC 501, Smith-Blair 441000001780900, Romac 501-17.80 x 17.80 or equal	Romac	\$282.00	\$8,460.00
A	17	25	EA	22025864	Coupling Trans CI-AC RB 10" No. 501-1140-1212, Smith-Blair 44112201160900, Romac 501-12.12 x 12.12 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$112.00	\$2,800.00
A	18	90	EA	22025867	Coupling Trans CI-AC RB 12" No. 501-1355-1440, Smith-Blair 44114401350900, Romac 501-14 x 14.40 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$135.00	\$12,150.00

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension	
A	19	40	EA	22025870	Coupling Trans Ci-AC RB 16" No. 501-1740-1897, Smith-Blair 44119201780900, Romac 501-18.97 x 17.40 x 7 or equal	Romac	\$280.00	\$11,200.00	
								A:	\$130,876.00
								Sales Tax (8%):	\$10,470.08
								Total Section A with Tax	\$141,346.08
B	1	300	FT	22022421	PVC Water Pipe, 4". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$2.13	\$639.00	
B	2	3,620	FT	22022422	PVC Water Pipe, 6". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$4.23	\$15,312.60	
B	3	3,660	FT	22022430	PVC Water Pipe, 8". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$7.33	\$26,827.80	
B	4	300	FT	22022433	PVC Water Pipe, 10". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR18.*		\$11.00	\$3,300.00	
B	5	1,920	FT	22022437	PVC Water Pipe, 12". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$15.54	\$29,836.80	
B	6	500	FT	22022440	PVC Water Pipe, 16". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-905, DR-18.*		\$28.30	\$14,150.00	
								Total Section B:	\$90,066.20
								Sales Tax (8%):	\$7,205.30
								Total Section B with Tax:	\$97,271.50
								Total Section A & B with Sales Tax:	\$238,617.58

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Vendor: Hydro-Scape Products, Inc.

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	1	8	EA	22025595	Coupling Adapter Flange 4" Range = 4.74-5.10, Smith-Blair 9129005004-000, Romac, FCA501-5010 or equal	Romac	\$148.59	\$1,188.72
A	2	15	EA	2202599	Coupling, Adapter (Flanged), 6", 6.68-7.20 Range, for Cast Iron and Asbestos-Cement Machined Ends; Romac FCA501-720 or equal	Romac	\$189.55	\$2,843.25
A	3	15	EA	22025601	Coupling, Adapter (Flanged), 8", 8.99-9.40 Range, for Cast Iron and Asbestos-Cement Machined Ends; Romac FCA501-940 or equal,	Romac	\$260.54	\$3,908.10
A	4	217	EA	22025700	Coupling CI & A/C ME 6" with Alloy Bolt 6.86-7.20, Smith-Blair 44100000722900, Romac 501-7.20 x 7.20 or equal	Romac	\$101.08	\$21,934.36
A	5	216	EA	22025704	Coupling CI & A/C ME 8" with Alloy Bolt 8.99-9.40, Smith-Blair 44100000945900, Romac 501-9.4 x 9.40 x 5 or equal	Romac	\$128.06	\$27,660.96
A	6	30	EA	22025705	Coupling CI 10" 10.89" – 11.40", Smith-Blair 441000001160900, Romac501-11.40 x 11.40 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$176.69	\$5,300.70
A	7	60	EA	22025706	Coupling CI 12" with Alloy Bolts 13.15-13.55, Smith-Blair 441000001350900, Romac 501-13.55 x 13.55 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$212.50	\$12,750.00
A	8	60	EA	22025708	Coupling End-Cap CI & A/C–ME 6" 2" FIP 6.86-7.2, Smith-Blair 48200072206900, Romac EC501-7.20 or equal	Romac	\$137.48	\$8,248.80
A	9	100	EA	22025709	Coupling End-Cap CI & A/C-ME 8" 2" FIP 8.99-9.4, Smith-Blair 48200094506900, Romac EC501-9.40 or equal	Romac	\$186.12	\$18,612.00

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	10	50	EA	22025710	Coupling, End Cap, CI 10", with 2" Female Iron Pipe Thread on End Cap Plug 10.89-11.40 Range, with Low Alloy Bolts; (for Cast Iron); Romac EC501-11.40 or equal	Romac	\$340.74	\$17,037.00
A	11	20	EA	22025711	Coupling End Cap A/C-ME 12" 2" FIP 13.85-14.1, Smith-Blair 48200142006900, Romac ec01-14.10 or equal	Romac	\$434.19	\$8,683.80
A	12	20	EA	22025712	Coupling End-Cap CI 12" with 2" FIP 13.15-13.55, Smith-Blair 4820013500680, Romac ec501-13.55 or equal	Romac	\$434.19	\$8,683.80
A	13	10	EA	22025714	Coupling End-Cap CI & DI 16" with 2" FIP 17.05-17.4, Smith-Blair 48117800114903, Romac ec501-17.40 or equal	Romac	\$874.53	\$8,745.30
A	14	18	EA	22025721	Coupling Flex 2" with Galv Bolts, Romac 501-2.38 x 2.38 x 5 or equal	Romac	\$39.33	\$707.94
A	15	75	EA	22025730	Coupling Flex 4" with Alloy Bolts 4.8ODX5.10 CI, Smith-Blair 44100000510900, Romac 501-5.1 x 4.81 x 5 or equal	Romac	\$74.26	\$5,569.50
A	16	30	EA	22025735	Coupling Flex 16" CI-PVC 17.40-17.80 ROMAC 501, Smith-Blair 441000001780900, Romac 501-17.80 x 17.80 or equal	Romac	\$443.59	\$13,307.70
A	17	25	EA	22025864	Coupling Trans CI-AC RB 10" No. 501-1140-1212, Smith-Blair 44112201160900, Romac 501-12.12 x 12.12 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$176.69	\$4,417.25
A	18	90	EA	22025867	Coupling Trans CI-AC RB 12" No. 501-1355-1440, Smith-Blair 44114401350900, Romac 501-14 x 14.40 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$212.50	\$19,125.00

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	19	40	EA	22025870	Coupling Trans Ci-AC RB 16" No. 501-1740-1897, Smith-Blair 44119201780900, Romac 501-18.97 x 17.40 x 7 or equal	Romac	\$443.59	\$17,743.60
Total Section A:								\$206,467.78
Sales Tax (8%):								\$16,517.42
Total Section A with Tax:								\$222,985.20
B	1	300	FT	22022421	PVC Water Pipe, 4". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		No Bid	No Bid
B	2	3,620	FT	22022422	PVC Water Pipe, 6". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		No Bid	No Bid
B	3	3,660	FT	22022430	PVC Water Pipe, 8". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		No Bid	No Bid
B	4	300	FT	22022433	PVC Water Pipe, 10". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR18.*		No Bid	No Bid
B	5	1,920	FT	22022437	PVC Water Pipe, 12". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		No Bid	No Bid
B	6	500	FT	22022440	PVC Water Pipe, 16". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-905, DR-18.*		No Bid	No Bid
Total Section B:								\$0.00
Sales Tax (8%):								\$0.00
Total Section B with Tax:								\$0.00
Total Section A & B with Sales Tax:								\$222,985.20

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Vendor: Pacific Pipeline Supply

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	1	8	EA	22025595	Coupling Adapter Flange 4" Range = 4.74-5.10, Smith-Blair 9129005004-000, Romac, FCA501-5010 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$110.00	\$880.00
A	2	15	EA	2202599	Coupling, Adapter (Flanged), 6", 6.68-7.20 Range, for Cast Iron and Asbestos-Cement Machined Ends; Romac FCA501-720 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$123.00	\$1,845.00
A	3	15	EA	22025601	Coupling, Adapter (Flanged), 8", 8.99-9.40 Range, for Cast Iron and Asbestos-Cement Machined Ends; Romac FCA501-940 or equal,	Romac/Powerseal	\$162.00	\$2,430.00
A	4	217	EA	22025700	Coupling CI & A/C ME 6" with Alloy Bolt 6.86-7.20, Smith-Blair 44100000722900, Romac 501-7.20 x 7.20 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$62.00	\$13,454.00
A	5	216	EA	22025704	Coupling CI & A/C ME 8" with Alloy Bolt 8.99-9.40, Smith-Blair 44100000945900, Romac 501-9.4 x 9.40 x 5 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$79.00	\$17,064.00
A	6	30	EA	22025705	Coupling CI 10" 10.89" – 11.40", Smith-Blair 441000001160900, Romac501-11.40 x 11.40 x 6 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$110.00	\$3,300.00
A	7	60	EA	22025706	Coupling CI 12" with Alloy Bolts 13.15-13.55, Smith-Blair 441000001350900, Romac 501-13.55 x 13.55 x 6 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$131.00	\$7,860.00
A	8	60	EA	22025708	Coupling End-Cap CI & A/C–ME 6" 2" FIP 6.86-7.2, Smith-Blair 48200072206900, Romac EC501-7.20 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$85.00	\$5,100.00
A	9	100	EA	22025709	Coupling End-Cap CI & A/C-ME 8" 2" FIP 8.99-9.4, Smith-Blair 48200094506900, Romac EC501-9.40 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$115.00	\$11,500.00

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	10	50	EA	22025710	Coupling, End Cap, CI 10", with 2" Female Iron Pipe Thread on End Cap Plug 10.89-11.40 Range, with Low Alloy Bolts; (for Cast Iron); Romac EC501-11.40 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$210.00	\$10,500.00
A	11	20	EA	22025711	Coupling End Cap A/C-ME 12" 2" FIP 13.85-14.1, Smith-Blair 48200142006900, Romac ec01-14.10 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$272.00	\$5,440.00
A	12	20	EA	22025712	Coupling End-Cap CI 12" with 2" FIP 13.15-13.55, Smith-Blair 4820013500680, Romac ec501-13.55 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$272.00	\$5,440.00
A	13	10	EA	22025714	Coupling End-Cap CI & DI 16" with 2" FIP 17.05-17.4, Smith-Blair 48117800114903, Romac ec501-17.40 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$550.00	\$5,500.00
A	14	18	EA	22025721	Coupling Flex 2" with Galv Bolts, Romac 501-2.38 x 2.38 x 5 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$25.00	\$450.00
A	15	75	EA	22025730	Coupling Flex 4" with Alloy Bolts 4.8ODX5.10 CI, Smith-Blair 44100000510900, Romac 501-5.1 x 4.81 x 5 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$46.00	\$3,450.00
A	16	30	EA	22025735	Coupling Flex 16" CI-PVC 17.40-17.80 ROMAC 501, Smith-Blair 441000001780900, Romac 501-17.80 x 17.80 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$279.00	\$8,370.00
A	17	25	EA	22025864	Coupling Trans CI-AC RB 10" No. 501-1140-1212, Smith-Blair 44112201160900, Romac 501-12.12 x 12.12 x 6 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$110.00	\$2,750.00
A	18	90	EA	22025867	Coupling Trans CI-AC RB 12" No. 501-1355-1440, Smith-Blair 44114401350900, Romac 501-14 x 14.40 x 6 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$131.00	\$11,790.00

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	19	40	EA	22025870	Coupling Trans Ci-AC RB 16" No. 501-1740-1897, Smith-Blair 44119201780900, Romac 501-18.97 x 17.40 x 7 or equal	Romac/Powerseal	\$279.00	\$11,160.00
							Total Section A:	\$128,283.00
							Sales Tax (8%):	\$10,262.64
							Total Section A with Sales Tax:	\$138,545.64
B	1	300	FT	22022421	PVC Water Pipe, 4". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$2.04	\$612.00
B	2	3,620	FT	22022422	PVC Water Pipe, 6". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$4.03	\$14,588.60
B	3	3,660	FT	22022430	PVC Water Pipe, 8". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$6.98	\$25,546.80
B	4	300	FT	22022433	PVC Water Pipe, 10". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR18.*		\$10.45	\$3,135.00
B	5	1,920	FT	22022437	PVC Water Pipe, 12". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$14.76	\$28,339.20
B	6	500	FT	22022440	PVC Water Pipe, 16". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-905, DR-18.*		\$27.05	\$13,525.00
							Total Section B:	\$85,746.60
							Sales Tax (8%):	\$6,859.73
							Total Section B with Sales Tax:	\$92,606.33
							Total Section A & B with Sales Tax:	\$231,151.97

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Vendor: Western Water Works Supply Company

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	1	8	EA	22025595	Coupling Adapter Flange 4" Range = 4.74-5.10, Smith-Blair 9129005004-000, Romac, FCA501-5010 or equal	Romac	\$92.70	\$741.60
A	2	15	EA	2202599	Coupling, Adapter (Flanged), 6", 6.68-7.20 Range, for Cast Iron and Asbestos-Cement Machined Ends; Romac FCA501-720 or equal	Romac	\$119.50	\$1,792.50
A	3	15	EA	22025601	Coupling, Adapter (Flanged), 8", 8.99-9.40 Range, for Cast Iron and Asbestos-Cement Machined Ends; Romac FCA501-940 or equal,	Romac	\$162.60	\$2,439.00
A	4	217	EA	22025700	Coupling CI & A/C ME 6" with Alloy Bolt 6.86-7.20, Smith-Blair 44100000722900, Romac 501-7.20 x 7.20 or equal	Romac	\$63.70	\$13,822.90
A	5	216	EA	22025704	Coupling CI & A/C ME 8" with Alloy Bolt 8.99-9.40, Smith-Blair 44100000945900, Romac 501-9.4 x 9.40 x 5 or equal	Romac	\$80.00	\$17,280.00
A	6	30	EA	22025705	Coupling CI 10" 10.89" – 11.40", Smith-Blair 441000001160900, Romac501-11.40 x 11.40 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$111.10	\$3,333.00
A	7	60	EA	22025706	Coupling CI 12" with Alloy Bolts 13.15-13.55, Smith-Blair 441000001350900, Romac 501-13.55 x 13.55 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$133.30	\$7,998.00
A	8	60	EA	22025708	Coupling End-Cap CI & A/C–ME 6" 2" FIP 6.86-7.2, Smith-Blair 48200072206900, Romac EC501-7.20 or equal	Romac	\$86.40	\$5,184.00
A	9	100	EA	22025709	Coupling End-Cap CI & A/C-ME 8" 2" FIP 8.99-9.4, Smith-Blair 48200094506900, Romac EC501-9.40 or equal	Romac	\$116.70	\$11,670.00

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	10	50	EA	22025710	Coupling, End Cap, CI 10", with 2" Female Iron Pipe Thread on End Cap Plug 10.89-11.40 Range, with Low Alloy Bolts; (for Cast Iron); Romac EC501-11.40 or equal	Romac	\$214.00	\$10,700.00
A	11	20	EA	22025711	Coupling End Cap A/C-ME 12" 2" FIP 13.85-14.1, Smith-Blair 48200142006900, Romac ec01-14.10 or equal	Romac	\$273.70	\$5,474.00
A	12	20	EA	22025712	Coupling End-Cap CI 12" with 2" FIP 13.15-13.55, Smith-Blair 4820013500680, Romac ec501-13.55 or equal	Romac	\$271.75	\$5,435.00
A	13	10	EA	22025714	Coupling End-Cap CI & DI 16" with 2" FIP 17.05-17.4, Smith-Blair 48117800114903, Romac ec501-17.40 or equal	Romac	\$548.50	\$5,485.00
A	14	18	EA	22025721	Coupling Flex 2" with Galv Bolts, Romac 501-2.38 x 2.38 x 5 or equal	Romac	\$24.75	\$445.50
A	15	75	EA	22025730	Coupling Flex 4" with Alloy Bolts 4.8ODX5.10 CI, Smith-Blair 44100000510900, Romac 501-5.1 x 4.81 x 5 or equal	Romac	\$69.90	\$5,242.50
A	16	30	EA	22025735	Coupling Flex 16" CI-PVC 17.40-17.80 ROMAC 501, Smith-Blair 441000001780900, Romac 501-17.80 x 17.80 or equal	Romac	\$276.85	\$8,305.50
A	17	25	EA	22025864	Coupling Trans CI-AC RB 10" No. 501-1140-1212, Smith-Blair 44112201160900, Romac 501-12.12 x 12.12 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$110.85	\$2,771.25
A	18	90	EA	22025867	Coupling Trans CI-AC RB 12" No. 501-1355-1440, Smith-Blair 44114401350900, Romac 501-14 x 14.40 x 6 or equal	Romac	\$133.90	\$12,051.00

**Bid Tabulation for
Bid No. 10060988-15-F**

Section	Item No.	Est. Qty	U/M	City Stock No.	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Cost	Extension
A	19	40	EA	22025870	Coupling Trans Ci-AC RB 16" No. 501-1740-1897, Smith-Blair 44119201780900, Romac 501-18.97 x 17.40 x 7 or equal	Romac	\$279.60	\$11,184.00
Total Section A:								\$131,354.75
Sales Tax (8%):								\$10,508.38
Total Section A with Sales Tax:								\$141,863.13
B	1	300	FT	22022421	PVC Water Pipe, 4". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$2.00	\$600.00
B	2	3,620	FT	22022422	PVC Water Pipe, 6". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$4.00	\$14,480.00
B	3	3,660	FT	22022430	PVC Water Pipe, 8". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$6.95	\$25,437.00
B	4	300	FT	22022433	PVC Water Pipe, 10". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR18.*		\$10.60	\$3,180.00
B	5	1,920	FT	22022437	PVC Water Pipe, 12". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-900, DR-18.*		\$14.75	\$28,320.00
B	6	500	FT	22022440	PVC Water Pipe, 16". Any Manufacturer meeting AWWA C-905, DR-18.*		\$26.10	\$13,050.00
Total Section B:								\$85,067.00
Sales Tax (8%):								\$6,805.36
Total Section B with Sales Tax:								\$91,872.36
Total Section A & B with Sales Tax:								\$233,735.49